
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Paramedic Practice 

Education provider University of Brighton 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 15 January 2016 

 
Panel: Joy Tweed (Chair) Joanna Mussen 
 Sonya Lam Stephen Wordsworth 
 Eileen Mullan  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Joy Tweed, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  Dip HE Paramedic Practice (SWAST) 

Education provider University of Cumbria 

Mode of delivery  FLX (Flexible) 

Date of decision 15 January 2016 

 
Panel: Joy Tweed (Chair) Joanna Mussen 
 Sonya Lam Stephen Wordsworth 
 Eileen Mullan  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Joy Tweed, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  Dip HE Paramedic Practice (NWAST) 

Education provider University of Cumbria 

Mode of delivery  FLX (Flexible) 

Date of decision 15 January 2016 

 
Panel: Joy Tweed (Chair) Joanna Mussen 
 Sonya Lam Stephen Wordsworth 
 Eileen Mullan  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Joy Tweed, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  Diploma of Higher Education Paramedic Practice 

Education provider Edge Hill University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 15 January 2016 

 
Panel: Joy Tweed (Chair) Joanna Mussen 
 Sonya Lam Stephen Wordsworth 
 Eileen Mullan  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Joy Tweed, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Paramedic Science 

Education provider The University of Northampton 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 15 January 2016 

 
Panel: Joy Tweed (Chair) Joanna Mussen 
 Sonya Lam Stephen Wordsworth 
 Eileen Mullan  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Joy Tweed, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Paramedic Science 

Education provider The University of Northampton 

Mode of delivery  PT (Part time) 

Date of decision 15 January 2016 

 
Panel: Joy Tweed (Chair) Joanna Mussen 
 Sonya Lam Stephen Wordsworth 
 Eileen Mullan  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Joy Tweed, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  BSc (Hons) Operating Department Practice 

Education provider University of Portsmouth 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 15 January 2016 

 
Panel: Joy Tweed (Chair) Joanna Mussen 
 Sonya Lam Stephen Wordsworth 
 Eileen Mullan  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Joy Tweed, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes in respect of which approval is recommended subject to 
conditions 
 

Programme name  Diploma in Higher Education Paramedic Practice 

Education provider University of Sunderland 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Date of decision 15 January 2016 

 
Panel: Joy Tweed (Chair) Joanna Mussen 
 Sonya Lam Stephen Wordsworth 
 Eileen Mullan  

 

Decision 

 
That the Visitors’ report (including the conditions and recommendations in the 
report) should be accepted.  
 

Reasons  

 
The Panel is satisfied that the conditions in the Visitors’ report must be met 
before the programme can be approved or before the ongoing approval of the 
programme can be confirmed. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Joy Tweed, Panel Chair 


