
CONSULTATION DRAFT 

These Rules, if made by the HCPC, would be a Schedule to an Order of Council 
made by the Privy Council and laid before the UK and Scottish Parliaments. 

 

 

The Health and Care Professions Council (Registration and Fees) 

(Amendment) Rules 2019 

The Health and Care Professions Council makes the following Rules in exercise of the powers 

conferred by articles 7(1) and (2) and 41(2) of the Health and Social Work Professions Order 

2001. 

In accordance with articles 7(1) and (3) and 41(3) of that Order, the Health and Care 

Professions Council has consulted the Education and Training Committee and representatives 

of groups of persons it considers appropriate, including representatives of the groups listed in 

article 41(3) of that Order. 

 

Citation and commencement 

1. These Rules may be cited as the Health and Care Professions Council (Registration and Fees) 

(Amendment) Rules 2019 and come into force on [date]. 

 

Amendment of the Health and Care Professions Council (Registration and Fees) Rules 

2003 

2.—(1) The Health and Care Professions Council (Registration and Fees) Rules 2003 are 

amended as follows. 

 

(2) For rule 14 (registration fee) substitute— 

“14. The fee to be charged for registration in respect of an applicant’s first registration 

period (as determined in accordance with rule 10(3)) is £212.”. 

 

(3) In rule 15 (renewal fee), for “£180” substitute “£212”. 

 

(4) In rule 15A (readmission fee) — 

(a) for “£135” substitute “£160”; and 

(b) for “14(b)” substitute “14”. 

 

(5) In rule 16 (restoration fee) — 

(a) for “£135” substitute “£160”; and 

(b) for “14(b)” substitute “14”. 

 

(6) In rule 17 (scrutiny fees)— 

(a) in paragraph (1) for “£63” substitute “£74”; and 

(b) in paragraph (2) for “£495” substitute “£584”. 

 

Given under the official seal of the Health and Care Professions Council this *** day of *** 

2019. 


